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1.

You are working on a project to redesign a company's website. To validate that the
new design is visually appealing and easy to navigate, which technique would be
most effective?

Develop an interactive prototype and conduct usability testing with
potential users

Conduct a walkthrough of the design with the development team

Create a static mockup of the website and gather feedback from stakeholders

Perform a gap analysis comparing the new design to competitor websites

Correct answer: Develop an interactive prototype and conduct usability testing with
potential users

An interactive prototype allows users to experience the website's navigation and
design firsthand, providing valuable feedback on usability, visual appeal, and overall
user experience. Usability testing with real users is crucial for identifying design flaws
and potential improvements.

A walkthrough session with the development team is helpful for understanding the
design but not for assessing user experience.

A static mockup doesn't allow users to interact with the design, limiting the feedback
they can provide.

Gap analysis focuses on comparing features with competitors, not validating user
experience.

Analysis



2.

In eliciting requirements for a new automated security gate business solution, you
need to ensure that all potential data entities and their relationships are captured.
Which model would be most helpful in this process?

Entity-relationship diagram

Process model

Event list

Wireframe

Correct answer: Entity-relationship diagram

Entity-relationship diagrams serve as a visual representation of data entities and their
interconnections, forming the basis for database design. These diagrams ensure a
holistic approach to data capture, facilitating the creation of a comprehensive
database structure.

Process models focus on the flow of activities, not data entities and relationships.

Event lists outline occurrences that trigger actions within the system, not data
structure.

Wireframes are visual representations of user interfaces, not data models.

Analysis



3.

Who should be involved in defining acceptance criteria?

Key stakeholders and subject-matter experts

Only the project manager

Only the development team

The entire project team

Correct answer: Key stakeholders and subject-matter experts

Key stakeholders and subject-matter experts are the individuals who have the most
knowledge about what constitutes a successful outcome. They can provide the
expertise and insights needed to define meaningful and achievable acceptance
criteria.

The project manager alone should not make this choice, as their role does not
necessitate solitary decision-making.

The development team's involvement is crucial, but their primary responsibility lies in
implementation rather than defining the success criteria.

The input of each team member is important, but the project team's key stakeholders
and subject-matter experts hold the most significant viewpoints.

Analysis



4.

What is a common technique used to elicit acceptance criteria from stakeholders?

Interviews

Brainstorming

Document analysis

Observation

Correct answer:  Interviews

Interviews provide a direct and focused way to engage stakeholders in discussions
about their expectations and what they consider a successful outcome. This allows
the business analyst to gather detailed and specific feedback for crafting acceptance
criteria.

Brainstorming is an effective technique for generating a wide range of ideas, but it
may not be the most efficient approach for identifying specific acceptance criteria.

Document analysis may offer partial insights, but it falls short in capturing the
comprehensive range of stakeholder expectations.

Observation is useful for comprehending current operations but not for determining
future results.

Analysis



5.

You are eliciting requirements for a new reporting system. Stakeholders have
requested various types of reports with different data elements and formats. 

Which technique would be most effective for organizing and documenting these data
requirements?

Data dictionary

Use case diagram

Requirements traceability matrix

Risk register

Correct answer: Data dictionary

A data dictionary provides a centralized repository for defining data elements, their
formats, meanings, and relationships. It is the ideal tool for documenting the various
data elements and their specifications for the reporting system.

Use case diagrams focus on user interactions, not the structure of data.

Requirements traceability matrices track relationships between requirements and
other artifacts, not the details of data elements.

Risk registers document project risks, not data specifications.

Analysis



6.

You are writing user stories for a new software system. Which of the following best
describes the purpose of a user story?
 

Describe a feature from the perspective of the user

Detail the technical specifications of a feature

Document the acceptance criteria for a feature

Outline the steps involved in implementing a feature

Correct answer: Describe a feature from the perspective of the user

User stories are short, simple descriptions of a feature from the user's point of view.
They focus on the user's goals and the value they expect to gain from the feature.

Technical specifications are separate from user stories and are usually addressed
during the design phase.

Acceptance criteria are part of a user story but don't encompass its entire purpose.

Implementation steps are technical details that are not included in the user story
itself.

Analysis



7.

What is a key characteristic of a successful sign-off meeting?

All stakeholders feel their opinions have been heard and considered

The project manager makes all the final decisions on the requirements

The meeting is kept as short as possible to avoid wasting time

Technical details of the requirements are discussed in depth

Correct answer: All stakeholders feel their opinions have been heard and considered

A successful sign-off meeting is collaborative and inclusive. All stakeholders should
have the opportunity to express their opinions and concerns and feel that their
feedback is valued. This fosters buy-in and commitment to the project.

The project manager facilitates the meeting but should not make unilateral decisions.

Rushing the meeting can lead to overlooked concerns and lack of understanding.

While technical details may be discussed briefly, the focus should be on stakeholder
understanding and agreement.

Analysis



8.

During a brainstorming session with stakeholders, you identify a potential new feature
for a product. This feature hasn't been thoroughly explored yet, and its details are
unclear. How would you classify this requirement in the product backlog?

Emergent

Detailed appropriately

Estimated

Prioritized

Correct answer: Emergent

Emergent requirements are those that are discovered or evolve during the project.
They haven't been fully defined or understood yet, which fits the description of this
new feature.

Detailed appropriately is the wrong choice here, as it implies the requirement is fully
understood and ready for development, which is not the case here.

The feature might eventually be estimated, but at this early stage, it's too undefined to
have a reliable estimate.

Prioritization typically happens once requirements are better understood.

Analysis



9.

What is the role of metrics in the context of acceptance criteria?

Quantify the performance and effectiveness of a deliverable

Provide a subjective assessment of quality

Track the progress of the project timeline

Identify potential risk to the project 

Correct answer: Quantify the performance and effectiveness of a deliverable

Metrics are used to measure the success of a deliverable against the defined
acceptance criteria. They provide objective data to evaluate whether the criteria have
been met.

Metrics are designed to offer objective and quantifiable evaluations in contrast to
subjective quality assessments.

For tracking the project timeline's advancement, metrics are valuable tools. Their
main purpose, however, is to assess progress against the established acceptance
criteria rather than solely serving as progress tracking mechanisms.

Risk management activities aim to identify potential project risks, not metrics. 

Analysis



10.

A business analyst wants to quickly gather feedback on a potential user interface
design. Which tool would be most effective?

Prototype

CRUD matrix

Report table

Context diagram

Correct answer: Prototype

Prototypes are interactive models that allow users to experience and provide
feedback on a design before full development.

CRUD matrices define basic data operations, not user interfaces.

Report tables present structured data, not interactive designs.  

Context diagrams show system boundaries, not user interface details.

Analysis



11.

What is the main purpose of conducting a formal walkthrough of the requirements
baseline with stakeholders?

Ensure that all stakeholders understand and agree upon the
documented requirements

Identify and resolve any remaining defects or ambiguities in the requirements

Prioritize the requirements based on their business value and urgency

Estimate the cost and resources required to implement the requirements

Correct answer: Ensure that all stakeholders understand and agree upon the
documented requirements

A walkthrough is a structured review where the project team presents and explains
the requirements to stakeholders. Its primary purpose is to foster shared
understanding, clarify any doubts or questions, and ensure that everyone agrees on
the scope of the project as defined in the requirements baseline.

Walkthroughs can sometimes reveal minor issues, but their main goal is not defect
identification.

Prioritization is typically done before the walkthrough, during the requirements
analysis phase.

Cost and resource estimation occur during project planning, not the requirements
walkthrough.

Analysis



12.

During a requirements review session, a stakeholder suggests using a specific third-
party software library for a particular functionality. Where should this information be
documented?

Solution requirements section

Use case description

Non-functional requirements section

Glossary or assumptions section

Correct answer: Solution requirements section

Solution requirements capture the specific features, functionalities, or characteristics
that the solution must possess to meet the business needs. The use of a third-party
library directly impacts the solution design and should be documented in this section.

Use case descriptions focus on user interactions, not specific technology choices.

Non-functional requirements deal with system qualities (e.g., performance, security),
not specific components.

Glossary and assumptions sections clarify terms and assumptions, not specific
solution decisions.

Analysis



13.

Your team is developing a new medical device software. To validate the requirements
and ensure it adheres to strict regulatory standards, which technique would be most
critical?

Compliance review

Peer review

Simulation 

User acceptance testing 

Correct answer: Compliance review

A compliance review is a systematic examination of the requirements and design
against relevant regulations and standards. This is essential for medical device
software to ensure patient safety and regulatory compliance.

Peer reviews are important for general quality but not specifically focused on
regulatory compliance.

Simulations are helpful for testing functionality but not a substitute for a compliance
review.

User acceptance testing validates user needs but doesn't guarantee regulatory
compliance.

Analysis



14.

You are working on a project with several stakeholders who have conflicting priorities
regarding the requirements. Which decision-making technique would be most
appropriate for reaching a consensus on the final requirements baseline?

Multivoting

Brainstorming

Decision tree

SWOT analysis

Correct answer: Multivoting

Multivoting is a collaborative technique that allows stakeholders to quickly narrow
down a large list of options by voting on their preferences. This helps identify the
requirements with the most support and can facilitate consensus when priorities differ.

Brainstorming is useful for generating ideas but not for making final decisions.

Decision trees are helpful for evaluating options with uncertainty but not for prioritizing
requirements with conflicting stakeholder views.

SWOT analysis is a strategic planning tool, not a decision-making technique for
prioritizing requirements.

Analysis



15.

You are defining acceptance criteria for a user story related to a new online payment
feature. Which of the following statements would be an example of a well-written
acceptance criterion?

"When a user clicks the Pay Now button, the system should process the
payment and display a confirmation message within 5 seconds."

“The payment feature should be easy to use and understand by all the end
users.”

“The system should allow users to make payments using various methods
within a specific on-screen time period.”

“The payment feature should be secure.”

Correct answer: "When a user clicks the Pay Now button, the system should process
the payment and display a confirmation message within 5 seconds."

A well-written acceptance criterion is Specific, Measurable, Achievable, Relevant, and
Time-bound (SMART). The correct response meets these criteria, as it clearly states
the action (clicking Pay Now), the expected outcome (processing payment and
displaying confirmation), and the time frame (within 5 seconds).

All the other responses are too vague and subjective and not specific enough to be
considered as acceptable criterion. 

Analysis



16.

Your company is launching a new mobile app. You want to quickly test the market and
gather user feedback with minimal investment. Which approach would be most
suitable?

Develop a minimum viable product (MVP) with essential features

Release a fully-featured app with all functionalities

Create a detailed prototype to showcase the app's visual design

Conduct a focus group with potential users to discuss their needs

Correct answer: Develop a minimum viable product (MVP) with essential features

By developing a Minimum Viable Product (MVP), you can introduce a basic version of
your app to early customers to elicit feedback and validate your concept. This MVP
should include only the essential features needed to satisfy those initial users,
allowing you to test the market, gather valuable insights, and reduce the risk of
investing in unnecessary features. The feedback obtained through this process helps
identify areas for improvement and informs future product development, ensuring that
your app aligns with customer needs and preferences.

A fully featured app is expensive and risky before market validation.

A prototype demonstrates visuals, not functionality for user testing.

Focus groups provide insights, not real-world usage data.

Analysis



17.

Your team is designing a new customer relationship management system. You need
to define which user roles have permission to perform specific actions on customer
data, such as creating, viewing, updating, or deleting records. 

Which tool would be most helpful for this purpose? 

CRUD matrix

Risk burndown chart

Interaction matrix

Event list 

Correct answer: CRUD matrix

A CRUD (Create, Read, Update, Delete) matrix is a table that shows the permissions
of different user roles to perform specific actions on data entities. In this scenario, it
would clearly define which roles can create new customer records, view existing
ones, modify them, or delete them.

Risk burndown charts track the reduction of risks over time, not user permissions.

Interaction matrices show the interactions between different system components or
actors, not user permissions on data.

In a system, event lists include triggers and occurrences that can happen, excluding
user permissions.

Analysis



18.

Your team is developing a mobile app for ordering food from local restaurants. Which
of the following would be the most appropriate format to capture user interactions and
system responses for the Place Order feature?

Use case

Data dictionary

User story

Acceptance criteria 

Correct answer: Use case

A use case describes a specific interaction between a user (actor) and the system to
achieve a particular goal, like placing an order. It outlines the steps involved, user
inputs, system responses, and potential alternative paths.

Data dictionaries define data elements and their attributes, not user interactions.

User stories provide a high-level user perspective, not detailed interaction steps.

Acceptance criteria work to define the conditions for successful completion of a
feature, not the detailed interaction process.

Analysis



19.

Your team has just completed a prototype for a new mobile game. What is the next
step in the requirements validation process?

Conduct user acceptance testing to gather feedback from a wider
audience

Release the game to the market for a limited beta launch

Begin developing the final version of the game based on the prototype

Conduct a compliance review to ensure the game meets regulatory standards

Correct answer: Conduct user acceptance testing to gather feedback from a wider
audience

After validating the prototype with a small group of users, the next step is to conduct
user acceptance testing with a broader audience to gather more comprehensive
feedback and identify any remaining issues before finalizing the requirements and
proceeding with development.

A beta launch typically occurs later in the development process after user acceptance
testing.

Developing the final version before user acceptance testing is risky, as it might lead to
rework if significant issues are discovered later.

A compliance review is important. It should be conducted alongside or after user
acceptance testing to ensure the final product meets regulatory requirements.

Analysis



20.

A stakeholder expresses concerns that a requirement for a new reporting tool might
be too complex for end users to understand. Which validation method would be most
helpful in addressing this concern?

Usability testing

Demo

Prototype

Inspection 

Correct answer: Usability testing

Usability testing involves observing real users as they interact with the product. This
is the best way to assess if the reporting tool is too complex, as it provides direct
feedback on user comprehension and ease of use.

A demo can showcase the tool, but it may not reveal if users find it complex to
navigate or understand.

Similar to demos, prototypes may not fully capture real-world usability issues.

Inspections focus on document reviews and won't reveal how actual users interact
with the tool.

Analysis



21.

Stakeholders are having difficulty understanding the potential value of a proposed
solution. Which model would be best suited to address this concern?

Business objectives model

Data model

Rule model

Ecosystem map

Correct answer: Business objectives model

Business objectives models serve as vital tools in aligning technology solutions with
organizational strategies. They establish a direct connection between the proposed
solution and specific business goals, creating a framework for evaluating its potential
value. 

Data models show the structure of information, not the business value of a solution.

Rule models define business rules and constraints, not overall value propositions.

Ecosystem maps show relationships between organizations, not the internal business
value of a solution. 

Analysis



22.

You are conducting a requirements validation review. Which of the following is not a
typical technique used during this process?

Brainstorming new requirements

Document review

Interview with stakeholders

Prototyping and demonstrations 

Correct answer: Brainstorming new requirements

Requirements validation focuses on verifying that the documented requirements are
accurate, complete, and meet the business needs. Brainstorming new requirements
is a separate activity that typically occurs during the elicitation phase.

All the following are typical techniques used during a requirements validation review:

Document review is a core technique in requirements validation. It involves
carefully examining requirement documents (like user stories, use cases,
specifications) to check for inconsistencies, ambiguities, or errors.
Interviews are a valuable tool for validating requirements. They allow you to
directly discuss the requirements with stakeholders, clarify any doubts, and
confirm their understanding and agreement.
Prototypes and demonstrations (demos) are visual and interactive
representations of the requirements. They are effective in helping stakeholders
visualize the solution and provide feedback on whether it meets their needs.

Analysis



23.

Which elicitation technique involves analyzing users in their natural environment to
understand their work processes and needs?

Observation

Brainstorming

1:1 interviews

Surveys

Correct answer: Observation

Through direct observation, valuable information regarding user behaviors, including
their frustrations and potential areas for enhancement, can be gathered. This
technique has the potential to uncover profound insights that may not be readily
apparent through alternative methods.

Brainstorming, as a group technique for generating ideas, falls short in offering
opportunities to explore user behaviors in their work environments. This limits the
understanding of their work processes and best practices.

Interviews entail direct, face-to-face conversations aimed at collecting valuable
information, but they fall short of being classified as observation methods.

Rather than being a form of observation, surveys serve the purpose of collecting
information from a significant portion of the population.

Analysis



24.

During a requirements review session, a stakeholder raises concerns about a specific
requirement that they believe is not feasible within the project budget. What would be
the most appropriate way to address this concern?

Facilitate a discussion to explore alternative solutions that could meet
the stakeholder's needs within the budget constraints

Dismiss the concern and assure the stakeholder that the requirement is
feasible

Agree to move the requirement from the project scope immediately

Escalate the issue to the project sponsor and let them decide how to proceed

Correct answer: Facilitate a discussion to explore alternative solutions that could
meet the stakeholder's needs within the budget constraints

As a business analyst, your role is to facilitate communication and collaboration
between stakeholders. In this situation, it's important to explore alternative solutions
that could address the stakeholder's concerns while still meeting the project goals.

Dismissing the concern could damage stakeholder relationships and lead to
dissatisfaction later.

Agreeing to remove the requirement from the project scope immediately may not be
necessary. There might be alternative solutions that satisfy both the stakeholder and
the project constraints.

Escalation may be necessary in some cases, but it's usually best to try to resolve the
issue collaboratively first.

Analysis



25.

What should you avoid doing during a requirements elicitation interview?

Interrupting the stakeholder

Preparing a list of open-ended questions

Actively taking notes

Summarizing key points

Correct answer: Interrupting the stakeholder

Interrupting can disrupt the flow of conversation and make the stakeholder feel
unheard. Business analysts should always focus on listening and understanding,
reserving their opinions for later analysis and discussion.

Preparing a list of open-ended questions to guide the discussion is a good practice
that helps ensure a structured and productive conversation.

Actively taking notes to capture important details and insights is crucial for
documenting the requirements and ensuring accuracy.

Summarizing key points at the end of the interview to confirm understanding helps
validate the business analyst’s understanding and identify any areas that need further
clarification.

Analysis



26.

You are eliciting requirements for a new customer relationship management system.
Stakeholders have provided a list of high-level needs, but you need to break them
down into more detailed and actionable requirements. 

Which technique would be most suitable for this?

Requirements decomposition

Dependency analysis

Interface analysis

Data modeling 

Correct answer: Requirements decomposition

Requirements decomposition involves breaking down high-level requirements into
smaller, more manageable components. This helps ensure clarity and completeness
and that each requirement is actionable for development.

Dependency analysis identifies relationships between requirements, not breaking
them down into details.

Interface analysis defines how components interact, not the details of individual
requirements.

Data modeling focuses on data structure, not decomposing requirements.

Analysis



27.

You want to visually depict the interactions between different actors and the system
being analyzed for a business solution. Which modeling technique is most
appropriate?

Use case diagram

Data model

Decision table 

Goal model 

Correct answer: Use case diagram

Use case diagrams visually depict the interactions between users (actors) and the
system's functionalities. They are a type of interaction matrix that provides a high-
level overview of the system's behavior from the user's perspective.

Data models serve as visual representations of the structure and organization of
information within a system.

Decision tables present conditions and associated actions, but they do not capture
interactions between actors and the system.

Goal models describe the objectives a system is intended to achieve.

Analysis



28.

You are working on a project to improve the UX on a company's website. Which of
the following metrics would be most relevant for measuring the success of this
project?

Customer satisfaction rating

Average page load time 

Number of website visitors

Number of products sold

Correct answer: Customer satisfaction rating

Since the project focuses on improving UX, which is the user experience, the most
relevant metric would be a measure of customer satisfaction, as it directly measures
how customers perceive their experience with the website.

Average page load time is important, but it's not the most relevant metric for
measuring customer experience.

Number of website visitors measures website traffic, but not necessarily satisfaction.

Number of products sold measures sales performance, but not necessarily customer
experience.

Analysis



29.

You are documenting the requirements for an automotive navigation business
solution system. You need to capture the system’s essential functionalities. Which
modeling technique would be most appropriate for representing these requirements?

Use case diagram

State diagram

Story mapping

System interface table

Correct answer: Use case diagram

Use case diagram is the best fit here because it is a modeling tool used in systems
analysis and design to represent the functionality of a system from the perspective of
its users. It provides a graphical overview of the interactions between users and the
system and is particularly useful for capturing functional requirements.

A state diagram focuses on the different states the system can be in, which is not
relevant to capturing functional requirements.

Story mapping is used to organize user stories, which is a more informal way of
describing requirements.

A system interface table documents the interactions between different systems, not
the core functionalities within the system.

Analysis



30.

During requirements elicitation, which of the following should you do to ensure
effective communication with stakeholders?

Actively listen to stakeholders

Use technical jargon and acronyms 

Speak primarily about the project's constraints and limitations

Focus on presenting solutions

Correct answer: Actively listen to stakeholders

Active listening and paraphrasing are essential for building rapport, clarifying
expectations, and ensuring that business analysts accurately capture the
stakeholders' needs.

Using technical jargon and acronyms can alienate and confuse stakeholders who
may not be familiar with technical terms.

When eliciting requirement needs from stakeholders, the emphasis should primarily
be on grasping their requirements and goals from the onset. It is crucial to address
project restrictions and limitations, but the initial focus should be on understanding
their perspectives.

DIscussions about solutions should come after a thorough understanding of the
problem and requirements.

Analysis



31.

You are using the analytical hierarchy process to prioritize project requirements.
Which step in this process involves equating requirements to determine their relative
importance?

Developing pairwise comparison matrices

Establishing priorities

Synthesizing results

Performing sensitivity analysis 

Correct answer: Developing pairwise comparison matrices

In the analytical hierarchy process, pairwise comparison matrices are created to
compare each requirement against every other requirement, assigning a numerical
value to their relative importance.

Establishing priorities is the overall goal of the analytical hierarchy process.

Synthesizing results is done after creating the matrices.

Sensitivity analysis is done to check the robustness of the results.

Analysis



32.

Which of the following tools is primarily used to capture and prioritize stakeholder
needs and expectations in a structured format?

Kano model 

Requirements traceability matrix

Use case diagram

Context diagram

Correct answer: Kano model 

The Kano model categorizes customer needs into different types (basic,
performance, excitement) to help prioritize features and determine their impact on
customer satisfaction.

The requirements traceability matrix serves as a valuable tool for mapping and
monitoring the connections between requirements and related artifacts throughout the
development process.

Use case diagrams are used to visualize user interactions with a system.

Context diagrams define the boundaries of a system and its interactions with external
entities.

Analysis



33.

You are leading a project to develop a new mobile app. Due to budget constraints,
you can only include a limited number of features in the initial release. How would you
determine which features to prioritize?

Prioritize features based on their alignment with the project's business
goals and objectives

Consult with the development team to see which features are easiest to
implement

Conduct a survey of potential users to gauge their interest in different features

Randomly select features to avoid bias

Correct answer: Prioritize features based on their alignment with the project's
business goals and objectives

Prioritizing based on business goals ensures that the features that deliver the most
value to the business and stakeholders are developed first.

Ease of implementation should not be the primary driver for prioritization.

User surveys can be helpful, but the final decision should align with business
objectives.

Random selection does not ensure the most valuable features are prioritized.

Analysis



34.

During a requirements validation session, a stakeholder suggests a new requirement
that was not identified during elicitation. What is your most appropriate response?

Acknowledge the requirement, document it, and assess its impact

Reject the requirement immediately because it wasn't captured initially

Document the requirement and add it to the baseline without further analysis

Thank the stakeholder for their input and explain that new requirements
cannot be considered at this stage

Correct answer: Acknowledge the requirement, document it, and assess its impact

New requirements can emerge even after initial elicitation. A professional BA should
acknowledge the suggestion, document it formally as a change request, and then
evaluate its impact on the project scope, timeline, and budget.

Rejecting the requirement outright can alienate stakeholders and miss potential
valuable additions.

Adding it without analysis can lead to scope creep and unforeseen consequences.

While explaining the formal change process is important, simply dismissing the
suggestion isn't constructive.

Analysis



35.

While analyzing requirements, you discover that a nice-to-have feature requires a
significant amount of development effort. What is the most appropriate course of
action?

Reevaluate the feature's priority in collaboration with stakeholders

Remove the feature from the scope to avoid unnecessary delays

Proceed with developing the feature, as it might delight the users

Defer the feature to a future phase of the project

Correct answer: Reevaluate the feature's priority in collaboration with stakeholders

The feature might be nice to have, but the development effort it demands
necessitates a careful review. It's crucial to reengage stakeholders to discuss the
value proposition versus the effort required and make an informed decision about its
priority.

Removing the feature without stakeholder input might overlook potential value.

Proceeding without considering the effort could lead to delays and cost overruns.

Deferring without reevaluation might mean missing an opportunity to deliver value if
the feature is actually important.

Analysis



36.

You are preparing to present the requirements baseline to stakeholders for final sign-
off. Which of the following is the most important factor to consider when selecting the
presentation format?

The stakeholders' preferred communication styles

Technical complexity of the requirements

Project manager's availability

Amount of time allocated for the presentation

Correct answer: The stakeholders' preferred communication styles

Understanding and catering to the stakeholders' preferred communication styles (e.g.,
visual, auditory, kinesthetic) ensures the information is presented in a way they can
easily understand and digest, leading to more effective decision-making.

Technical complexity is a factor, but it should not dictate the presentation format. The
goal is to make the requirements clear to all stakeholders regardless of their technical
background.

The project manager's availability is important for scheduling but not for selecting the
presentation format.

The allocated time should be considered, but the primary focus should be on effective
communication of the requirements regardless of time constraints.

Analysis



37.

You are working on a project to automate a complex manufacturing process. To
ensure the requirements accurately reflect the intricate workflows and dependencies,
which validation method would be most suitable?

Simulation

Walkthrough

Inspection

Prototype 

Correct answer: Simulation

Simulation allows you to model the manufacturing process and test the requirements
under various scenarios. This helps identify potential bottlenecks, errors, or
inconsistencies in the requirements before implementation.

Walkthroughs are useful for explaining requirements but not for testing complex
processes.

Inspections primarily focus on identifying errors in documentation, not validating
complex processes.

Prototypes may not be feasible for complex manufacturing processes and might not
accurately represent the intricacies of the workflow.

Analysis



38.

You're working on a large project with a distributed team. Which technique would best
ensure that everyone's voice is heard?

Online tool with real-time collaboration features

Brainstorming session with all team members

Email surveys to gather individual preferences

Face-to-face meeting with key stakeholders

Correct answer: Online prioritization tool with real-time collaboration features

For a distributed team, an prioritization online tool allows for asynchronous input, real-
time collaboration, and transparent tracking of prioritization decisions. This fosters
inclusivity and ensures everyone's voice is heard regardless of location.

Brainstorming sessions might be difficult to schedule and manage across time zones.

Email surveys lack the interactive discussion needed for effective prioritization.

Face-to-face meetings might not be feasible for a distributed team.

Analysis



39.

Which of the following is not a typical criterion used in evaluating solution options?

Project timeline

Technical feasibility

Strategic alignment

Stakeholder impact

Correct answer: Project timeline

Timelines are important for project planning and execution, but they are not a direct
criterion for evaluating the suitability of a solution itself. The focus should be on
whether the solution meets the functional and non-functional requirements, aligns
with the organization's strategy, and has a positive impact on stakeholders.

Technical feasibility assesses whether the solution can be built with available
technology and resources.

Strategic alignment ensures the solution supports the organization's overall goals and
objectives.

Stakeholder impact considers how the solution will affect different stakeholders and
their needs.

Analysis



40.

What is the primary purpose of a sign-off document for the requirements baseline?

Formally record stakeholder agreement and commitment to the
requirements

Document the project's overall objectives and success criteria

Serve as a legal contract between the project team and stakeholders

Provide a detailed technical specification of the solution

Correct answer: Formally record stakeholder agreement and commitment to the
requirements

The sign-off document is a formal record of stakeholder approval of the requirements
baseline. It confirms their understanding of the requirements and their commitment to
the project scope as defined in the document.

Project objectives are typically documented in the project charter.

The sign-off document is not a legal contract, although it can be referenced in
contracts.

Technical specifications are usually separate documents developed during the design
phase.

Analysis



41.

What is the primary purpose of an interface specification in requirements
documentation?

Specify the interaction points between the system and its users or other
systems

Define the data elements and their attributes that will be used in the system

Describe the user's goals and needs for a particular feature or functionality

Outline the steps a user takes to complete a specific task within the system

Correct answer: Specify the interaction points between the system and its users or
other systems

An interface specification defines how the system will interact with users (e.g.,
through a graphical user interface) or with other systems (e.g., through APIs). It
details the screens, inputs, outputs, and data exchange formats.

Defining the data elements and their attributes is the purpose of a data dictionary.

Describing the user's goals and needs is the purpose of a user story.

Outlining the steps a user takes to complete a specific task is the purpose of a use
case.

Analysis



42.

You are writing requirements for a new mobile banking application. One of the
requirements is that the app must be able to process transactions securely. What is
this requirement best categorized as?

Non-functional requirement

Functional requirement

Stakeholder requirement

Technical requirements

Correct answer: Non-functional requirement

Non-functional requirements define the qualities or characteristics of a system, such
as performance, security, usability, and reliability. The requirement for secure
transaction processing falls under the security aspect, making it a non-functional
requirement.

A functional requirement defines what a system should do (e.g., transfer funds
between accounts).

A stakeholder requirement represents the needs or expectations of stakeholders.

A technical requirement specifies the technical aspects of a solution (e.g., the
programming language to be used).

Analysis



43.

You are analyzing a complex business process that involves multiple departments
and stakeholders. You need to identify the bottlenecks, inefficiencies, and potential
areas for improvement in the process. 

Which of the following modeling techniques would be most effective in visualizing the
flow of activities and resources within the process?

Process map

State diagram

Use case diagram

Interaction matrix

Correct answer: Process map

Process maps are specifically designed to represent the flow of activities and
resources within a process. Also called process flows, they use standardized symbols
to depict steps, decision points, inputs, outputs, and the sequence of events. This
visual representation makes it easier to identify bottlenecks, inefficiencies, and areas
for improvement.

Unlike activity flow diagrams, state diagrams emphasize the various system states
rather than the sequence of activities.

A use case diagram depicts interactions between users and a system rather than the
intricate steps involved in a process.

An interaction matrix shows relationships between components, not the flow of
activities in a process.

Analysis



44.

Which of the following is not a benefit of using user stories for requirements
specification?

Provide a detailed technical specification of the solution

Encourage collaboration between the development team and stakeholders

Focus on delivering value to the end user

Flexible and adaptable to changing requirements

Correct answer: Provide a detailed technical specification of the solution

User stories are intentionally high level and focused on user needs, not technical
implementation details. Those details are determined later in the design and
development phases.

User stories are often created collaboratively in workshops, promoting shared
understanding.

The so that clause in a user story emphasizes the value the user receives from the
feature.

User stories can be easily modified or added as requirements evolve.

Analysis



45.

When eliciting requirements from stakeholders with diverse backgrounds and
expertise, what should you avoid doing?

Presume all stakeholders have the same level of technical knowledge

Use visual aids and diagrams to illustrate complex concepts

Tailor communication styles to accommodate different learning preferences

Summarize key points and decisions in plain language for everyone's
understanding

Correct answer: Presume all stakeholders have the same level of technical
knowledge

Stakeholders may have varying levels of technical expertise, and it isn’t prudent to
assume each stakeholder has the same level of technical knowledge. Business
analysts should adapt their communication to ensure everyone understands the
requirements and their implications.

Visual aids can enhance understanding for both technical and non-technical
stakeholders and should be used during eliciting requirements.

To facilitate successful communication with all stakeholders, customizing
communication approaches to cater to diverse learning preferences is a prudent
strategy.

Summarizing key points and decisions in plain language for everyone's
understanding helps ensure clarity and avoids misunderstandings.

Analysis



46.

A project team is struggling to reach consensus on the requirements baseline due to
conflicting stakeholder interests. The project manager suggests using a technique
where each stakeholder can assign a numerical value to each requirement based on
its importance. 

What technique is the project manager proposing?

Prioritization matrix 

Multivoting

Delphi technique

Nominal group technique

Correct answer: Prioritization matrix

A prioritization matrix is a tool that allows stakeholders to assign numerical values to
requirements based on criteria such as business value, urgency, and feasibility. This
quantifies the relative importance of each requirement and helps facilitate discussions
and consensus.

Multivoting is a simple voting process that doesn't involve assigning numerical values.

The Delphi technique is a method for gathering expert opinions through multiple
rounds of questionnaires.

The Nominal group technique is a structured group discussion where participants
generate and rank ideas.

Analysis



47.

You are creating a system interface table to document the interactions between a new
inventory management system and the company's existing accounting system. 

Which of the following information would not typically be included in a system
interface table?

User interface design details

Data elements exchanged between systems

Frequency of data exchange

Communication protocols use

Correct answer: User interface design details

A system interface table focuses on the technical aspects of how two systems
communicate, not the design of user interfaces.

The following are all included in a system interface table:

Understanding how systems interact relies heavily on the crucial information
contained in data elements exchanged between them.
The timing and volume of data transfer are influenced by the rate at which data
is exchanged.
The communication protocols employed establish the specific rules and
mechanisms by which various systems interact and exchange information with
one another.

Analysis



48.

You are documenting the requirements for a new mobile app feature. You have
written the following user story: 

"As a user, I want to be able to track my expenses, so I can stay within my budget."

Which of the following is the most completed and refined version of this user story?

"As a user, I want a visually appealing expense tracking feature that
allows me to categorize expenses, set budgets, and receive alerts when
I'm approaching my spending limits."

"As a user, I want to be able to track my expenses."

"As a user, I want to track my expenses by category and date, so I can see
where my money is going and stay within my budget." 

"Develop an expense tracking feature."

Correct answer: "As a user, I want a visually appealing expense tracking feature that
allows me to categorize expenses, set budgets, and receive alerts when I'm
approaching my spending limits."

The correct response is the most completed and refined version of the user story
because it includes the following:

Role: User
Goal: Track expenses
Benefit: Stay within budget
Details: Additional details about the desired functionality (categorization,
budgets, alerts) that make the story more actionable for the development team.

A well-refined user story not only captures the essence of the requirement but also
provides enough context and detail to guide the development and testing process
effectively.

The statement, "As a user, I want to be able to track my expenses," lacks detail and
doesn't explain the benefit to the user.

The statement, "As a user, I want to track my expenses by category and date, so I
can see where my money is going and stay within my budget," provides more detail
than the previous example but still lacks the full scope of the desired functionality.

Analysis



The statement, "Develop an expense tracking feature,” is a task, not a user story. It
doesn't express the user's perspective or the value they seek. 



49.

Your team is building a system that reacts to specific occurrences or stimuli, both
from internal processes and the external environment. You need a structured way to
record these occurrences, the conditions that lead to them, and the actions the
system should take in response. 

Which tool would best facilitate this documentation?

Event list

CRUD matrix

Interaction matrix

Decision tree 

Correct answer: Event list

An event list is a comprehensive list of all possible events that can occur within a
system, along with their associated triggers, conditions, and responses. It helps
ensure that the system can handle all expected scenarios.

CRUD matrices focus on user permissions for data operations (Create, Read,
Update, Delete), not system triggers and responses.

Interaction matrices show relationships and dependencies between system
components or actors, not triggers and responses.

Decision trees help with decision-making based on different conditions but don't
specifically capture and organize triggers and their corresponding actions.

Analysis



50.

Your team has just completed drafting a set of detailed requirements for a new
software system. To ensure the requirements are accurate and complete, what would
be the most appropriate next step?

Conduct a peer review with subject-matter experts and stakeholders

Immediately begin developing the software based on the drafted requirements

Send the requirements document to the project sponsor for final approval

Create a risk burndown chart to track potential issues during development

Correct answer: Conduct a peer review with subject-matter experts and stakeholders

A peer review is the most appropriate next step after drafting requirements. It brings
in subject-matter experts and stakeholders who can scrutinize the requirements for
accuracy, completeness, and potential conflicts before development begins. This
helps to identify and fix issues early on, saving time and resources later in the project.

Starting development without review risks building a system on faulty requirements.

Sponsor approval is important, but expert review should precede it.

A risk burndown chart tracks risk mitigation, not requirement quality.

Analysis



51.

Your team is evaluating several potential solutions to address a business problem. As
the lead business analyst, you are responsible for facilitating a decision-making
process to select the most suitable solution. Which of the following techniques would
be most appropriate for comparing and ranking the solutions based on predetermined
criteria?

Decision matrix

SWOT analysis

Root cause analysis

Brainstorming

Correct answer: Decision matrix

A decision matrix, or decision table, is a tool used to evaluate and prioritize options
based on a set of criteria. It allows you to systematically compare different solutions
by assigning weights to the criteria and scoring each solution against those criteria.
This helps to make a more objective and informed decision.

A SWOT analysis (Strengths, Weaknesses, Opportunities, Threats) is used to assess
the internal and external factors that can impact a project or decision, but it's not a
decision-making tool itself.

Root cause analysis is used to identify the underlying causes of a problem, not to
compare solutions.

Brainstorming is a technique for generating ideas, not for making decisions.

Analysis



52.

Which of the following is not a typical component of a well-written user story?

Technical implementation details

Acceptance criteria

User role

User goal

Correct answer: Technical implementation details

User stories focus on the what (user needs and goals) and not the how (technical
implementation). Technical details are addressed later in the design and development
phases.

Acceptance criteria define the conditions for a user story to be considered complete
and meet the user's needs.

User role specifies who the user is and their perspective.

User goal describes what the user wants to achieve.

Analysis



53.

A project team is using the Delphi technique to reach a consensus on the
prioritization of requirements. What is a key characteristic of this technique?

It uses a series of questionnaires to gather and refine expert opinions
anonymously

It involves face-to-face meetings with stakeholders to discuss their
preferences

It requires stakeholders to vote on each requirement using a ranking system

It involves a facilitated group discussion, where participants brainstorm and
evaluate ideas

Correct answer:  It uses a series of questionnaires to gather and refine expert
opinions anonymously

The Delphi technique is a structured communication method that uses multiple
rounds of questionnaires to gather expert opinions. The responses are summarized
and shared with the group, who then refine their opinions based on the feedback.
This process continues until a consensus is reached. The anonymity of the responses
encourages honest and unbiased feedback.

Face-to-face meetings are not a characteristic of the Delphi technique.

Voting is a characteristic of multivoting, not the Delphi technique.

Facilitated group discussion is a characteristic of the Nominal group technique, not
the Delphi technique.

Analysis



54.

You are reviewing the results of a requirements validation survey sent to
stakeholders. Several stakeholders have indicated that a particular requirement is
unclear and needs further clarification. 

What is the best way to address this issue?

Meet individually with the stakeholders who expressed confusion

Provide a more detailed explanation of the requirement and survey results

Update the requirements document to include additional details and
definitions

Organize a group meeting with all stakeholders to discuss the requirement
and gather feedback

Correct answer: Meet individually with the stakeholders who expressed confusion

Individual follow-up meetings allow for a more personalized discussion and tailored
explanations, addressing the specific concerns of each stakeholder.

Adding explanations to the survey results document might not be seen by all
stakeholders and may not address the root of the confusion.

Updating the requirements document is a good step, but it's important to first
understand the specific points of confusion through direct communication.

A group meeting might be necessary later, but individual meetings are initially more
efficient for addressing specific concerns.

Analysis



55.

Which of the following is not a common measurement tool or technique used in
business analysis for evaluating whether a solution meets requirements?

SWOT analysis

Key performance indicators (KPIs)

Balanced scorecard

Earned value management (EVM)

Correct answer: SWOT analysis 

SWOT or Strengths, Weaknesses, Opportunities, Threats analysis is a strategic
planning and assessment tool used to evaluate a business's internal and external
environment. It can provide insights relevant to requirements, but it's not directly used
to measure the success of a solution against specific requirements.

Key Performance Indicators (KPIs) are quantifiable measures used to evaluate the
success of a project or initiative against strategic goals. They are directly tied to
measuring whether a solution meets requirements.

Balanced scorecards are strategic management tools that use a variety of metrics to
assess performance across different perspectives (financial, customer, internal
processes, learning & growth). They can be used to evaluate if a solution is meeting
requirements in a holistic way.

Earned Value Management (EVM) is primarily used in project management and can
be adapted to business analysis to measure project performance in terms of scope,
schedule, and cost, helping to evaluate if a solution is on track to meet requirements.

Analysis



56.

In a behavior-driven development approach, what is the role of a business analyst in
writing scenarios?

Collaborate with stakeholders to define scenarios in a  business-
oriented language

Define the technical implementation details of the scenarios

Write the test scripts based on the scenarios

Execute the scenarios and report the results to the development team

Correct answer: Collaborate with stakeholders to define scenarios in a business-
oriented language

Business analysts play a crucial role in behavior-driven development by translating
business requirements into scenarios that can be understood by both technical and
non-technical stakeholders. These scenarios serve as the basis for development and
testing.

Defining the technical implementation details of the scenarios is incorrect because
while business analysts are involved in defining the behavior of the system, they are
not responsible for determining the specific technical details of how it will be
implemented. That is the role of developers.

Scenarios serve as a basis for testing, but testers are typically responsible for writing
the actual test scripts in a behavior-driven development environment. They use the
scenarios as a guide to create automated tests that verify the system's behavior.

Executing the scenarios and reporting the results to the development team is not the
primary role of a business analyst in this instance. While they may be involved in
reviewing the results of automated tests, their main focus is on collaborating with
stakeholders to define and refine the scenarios that drive development and testing.

Analysis



57.

Which of the following is a don’t when prioritizing requirements?

Base prioritization solely on the opinions of the project team

Involve stakeholders in the prioritization process

Use a consistent set of criteria to evaluate requirements

Document the rationale behind the prioritization decisions

Correct answer: Base prioritization solely on the opinions of the project team

The project team's input is valuable, but prioritization should also consider the needs
and priorities of the stakeholders who will be using the solution.

Involving stakeholders in the prioritization process is essential for ensuring that the
final solution meets their needs and expectations.

Using a consistent set of criteria to evaluate requirements ensures fairness and
transparency in the prioritization process.

Documenting the rationale behind the prioritization decisions provides valuable
context and traceability for future reference.

Analysis



58.

You are gathering requirements for a new inventory tracking system. Stakeholders
have provided a long list of features and functions. What is the first step you should
take to analyze and decompose these requirements?

Categorize and prioritize the requirements based on their business
value 

Create a data model to represent the inventory data

Develop a process flow diagram to illustrate the inventory management
workflow

Identify the interfaces between the inventory system and other systems

Correct answer: Categorize and prioritize the requirements based on their business
value

Before diving into detailed analysis, it's important to understand the relative
importance of each requirement. Categorizing and prioritizing helps focus the
analysis on the most critical aspects and ensures that resources are allocated
effectively.

Data modeling creation comes later, after understanding the requirements and their
priorities.

Process modeling is also done later, once the requirements are clear and prioritized.

Interface analysis is important but not the first step in the decomposition process.

Analysis



59.

Which of the following is not a decision-making technique used in requirements
analysis?

SWOT analysis

Voting

Prioritization matrix

MoSCoW

Correct answer: SWOT analysis

SWOT is a strategic planning tool, not a primary decision-making technique for
specific requirements.

Voting is a straightforward and efficient method for assessing stakeholder agreement
on requirements.

Prioritization matrices are used to rank requirements based on weighted criteria.

MoSCoW is a prioritization technique that categorizes requirements into four groups:
Must have, Should have, Could have, and Won't have. This helps stakeholders
understand the importance of each requirement and focus on the most critical ones
first.

Analysis



60.

You are tasked with detailing the steps a customer takes to purchase a product from
an e-commerce website. The goal is to understand potential pain points and areas for
improvement. 

Which modeling technique would be most appropriate for illustrating this process?

User interface flow

State diagram

Use case diagram

Interaction matrix

Correct answer: User interface flow

A user interface flow is the most suitable choice, as it focuses on the user's journey
through the website's interface. It would show the sequence of screens the customer
encounters, the actions they take (clicking buttons, entering information), and any
decision points they face during the purchase process.

State diagrams are used to represent the different states of a system, which wouldn't
be the primary concern here.

Use case diagrams illustrate interactions between users and a system, but not the
specific steps within a process.

An interaction matrix displays the connections between components, but it does not
capture the flow of a user's actions.

Analysis



61.

A project team is designing a new online learning platform. They want to ensure that
the User Interface (UI) is intuitive and easy to navigate. Which technique would be
most helpful in refining the UI design?

Prototyping

Data modeling

Dependency analysis

Process modeling

Correct answer: Prototyping

Prototyping involves creating a working model of the User Interface (UI) to test and
refine its design. This allows users to provide feedback on usability, navigation, and
overall experience, leading to a more intuitive and user-friendly design.

Data modeling focuses on data structure, not UI design.

Dependency analysis identifies relationships between requirements, not UI design
elements.

Process modeling visualizes workflows, not the layout and interaction of UI elements.

Analysis



62.

You've facilitated a workshop to prioritize requirements. Which of the following
prioritization techniques did you most likely use to balance stakeholder needs with
project constraints?

MoSCoW method

SWOT analysis

Fishbone diagram

Risk breakdown structure

Correct answer: MoSCoW method

The MoSCoW method (Must have, Should have, Could have, Won't have) is a
prioritization technique specifically designed to categorize requirements based on
their importance and urgency in the context of project constraints.

SWOT analysis is used for strategic planning, not requirement prioritization.

Fishbone diagrams identify root causes of problems, not prioritize solutions.

Risk breakdown structures identify and categorize risks, not prioritize requirements.

Analysis



63.

A project has multiple stakeholders with conflicting priorities. Which of the following
techniques would be most effective in facilitating a collaborative decision-making
process to determine the final requirements baseline?

Requirements workshop

Voting

Dictatorship

Random selection 

Correct answer: Requirements workshop

A requirements workshop brings stakeholders together to discuss, negotiate, and
reach a consensus on the final requirements. This encourages collaboration and
ensures everyone has a voice in the decision-making process.

Voting can create winners and losers, leading to dissatisfaction among stakeholders.

Dictatorship doesn't consider the diverse needs and priorities of stakeholders.

Random selection is not a fair or effective way to prioritize requirements.

Analysis



64.

You are responsible for establishing the requirements baseline. Which of the following
is not a key component of a requirements baseline?

Solution design specifications

Functional and non-functional requirements

Stakeholder analysis

Business rules

Correct answer: Solution design specifications

The requirements baseline focuses on the what of the project: the needs and
constraints. Solution design specifications, which detail the how, come later in the
project lifecycle.

Functional and non-functional requirements are essential parts of defining the product
or service.

Stakeholder analysis is crucial for understanding needs and expectations.

Business rules define constraints and conditions that must be met.

Analysis



65.

A project team is using a prioritization matrix to rank requirements. Which of the
following is not a typical criterion used in a prioritization matrix?

Technical complexity

Business value

Urgency

Stakeholder satisfaction

Correct answer: Technical complexity

Technical complexity is an important factor to consider during solution design and
implementation, but it is not a primary criterion for prioritizing requirements. The focus
should be on the value and impact of the requirements for the stakeholders and the
business.

Business value is a critical criterion, as it reflects the potential impact of the
requirement on achieving the project's business objectives.

Urgency indicates how quickly the requirement needs to be implemented, often
driven by deadlines or external factors.

Stakeholder satisfaction considers the importance of the requirement to different
stakeholders and their overall satisfaction with the project outcome.

Analysis



66.

You are creating a use case diagram for a new library management system. What are
the primary elements represented in a use case diagram?

Actors, use cases, and relationships between them

Data entities, attributes, and relationships between them

System states, transitions, and triggering events

Processes, decision points, and data flows

Correct answer: Actors, use cases, and relationships between them

A use case diagram visually represents the interactions between actors (users or
external systems) and use cases (specific actions or functions). It provides a high-
level overview of the system's functionality from the user's perspective.

Data entities, attributes, and relationships between them describe a data model, not a
use case diagram.

System states, transitions, and triggering events describe a state diagram, not a use
case diagram.

Processes, decision points, and data flows describe a data flow diagram or process
flow diagram, not a use case diagram.

Analysis



67.

Your team has just completed the requirements analysis phase for a new software
product. You've carefully documented all the requirements, including user stories,
acceptance criteria, and supporting documentation. 

What is the next crucial step you should take to ensure that the project stays on track
and avoids scope creep?

Conduct a requirements review session with stakeholders

Begin development immediately based on the document requirements

Create a detailed project plan outlining the development timeline and resource
education

Start testing the software based on the document acceptance criteria

Correct answer: Conduct a requirements review session with stakeholders

Meeting with stakeholders to review the requirements and document and address
their concerns before obtaining sign-off on the requirements baseline is a critical step
in the requirements analysis process. It ensures that all stakeholders have a shared
understanding of the project scope and agree on the requirements before
development begins. This helps prevent scope creep, misunderstandings, and costly
rework later in the project. 

Starting development without sign-off risks building the wrong product or features.

Creating a project plan is important, but it should happen after the requirements are
finalized.

Testing should be based on finalized and approved requirements.

Analysis



68.

What is a key output of the assess proposed solution task?

Decision analysis results

Solution scope statement

Requirements traceability matrix

Vendor assessment report

Correct answer: Decision analysis results

The assess proposed solution task focuses on evaluating solution options. Decision
analysis techniques help determine the best fit based on various criteria.

Solution scope statements define the boundaries of the solution but are not a direct
output of the assessment process.

Requirements traceability matrices are used to link requirements to test cases and
other deliverables, not the outcome of assessing a solution.

Vendor assessment reports assess potential vendors, not the solutions themselves.

Analysis



69.

You are documenting the requirements for a new online banking system. You need to
specify the format and validation rules for a customer's account number. 

Which section of the requirements document would be the most appropriate place to
include this information?

Data requirements

Use case descriptions

Interface specifications

Non-functional requirements

Correct answer: Data requirements

The data requirements section of a requirements document outlines the specific data
elements, their formats, validation rules, and any constraints or business rules
associated with them. This is the appropriate place to specify the details of the
customer's account number.

Use case descriptions focus on user interactions, not specific data formats.

Interface specifications describe how the user interacts with the system, not the
specific data validation rules.

Non-functional requirements describe system qualities like performance or security,
not specific data formats.

Analysis



70.

During a monthly meeting, a project sponsor expresses a strong desire for the new
software system of a business solution project to be able to integrate with the
company's existing Customer Relationship Management (CRM) system. How should
you classify this information?

Stakeholder requirement 

Functional requirement

Nonfunctional requirement

Technical requirements

Correct answer: Stakeholder requirement

Stakeholder requirements are the needs or expectations of stakeholders regarding
the product or project. The project sponsor's desire for integration with the existing
Customer Relationship Management (CRM) system is a specific need they have
expressed, thus making it a stakeholder requirement.

Functional requirements define what a system should do (e.g., calculate sales tax).

Nonfunctional requirements define how a system should perform (e.g., be secure).

Technical requirements specify the technical aspects of a solution (e.g., use a specific
programming language).

Analysis



71.

During a requirements elicitation session, stakeholders express conflicting views on
the priority of different features for a new software application. What is the best
approach to resolve this conflict and reach a consensus?

Facilitate a discussion among stakeholders to understand their
reasoning and explore compromises

Make the decision yourself based on your expertise and understanding of the
requirements

Ask the project manager to decide which feature should be prioritized

Postpone decision until later in the project or when more information is
available 

Correct answer: Facilitate a discussion among stakeholders to understand their
reasoning and explore compromises

The best approach to resolving conflicting stakeholder views is to facilitate a
discussion where everyone can express their perspectives and concerns. By
understanding the reasoning behind their priorities, you can explore potential
compromises and solutions to reach a consensus that satisfies the needs of the
project and the stakeholders.

Making the decision yourself might alienate stakeholders and lead to resentment.

The project manager has authority, but the decision should ideally be made
collaboratively.

Delaying the decision might cause project delays and increase the risk of scope
creep.

Analysis



72.

During a requirements validation session, a stakeholder suggests that a particular
requirement might be unnecessary and could be removed without impacting the
overall project goals. What is the best way to proceed?

Facilitate a discussion to understand the stakeholder's reasoning and
assess the impact 

Remove the requirement immediately, as stakeholder input is always valuable

Insist on keeping the requirement, as it was included in the initial analysis
phase

Escalate the issue to the project manager for a final decision

Correct answer: Facilitate a discussion to understand the stakeholder's reasoning and
assess the impact

It's important to explore the stakeholder's concerns and understand why they believe
the requirement is unnecessary. By assessing the potential impact of removing the
requirement on the project scope, you can make an informed decision that considers
all perspectives.

Removing a requirement without analysis can lead to missing critical functionality.

Insisting on keeping the requirement without discussion can hinder collaboration and
potentially lead to a suboptimal solution.

Escalation may be necessary if no agreement is reached, but collaborative problem-
solving should be attempted first.

Analysis



73.

You're allocating requirements to project phases. Which of the following factors is
least important when deciding which requirements to implement early in the project?

Number of requirement changes

Stakeholder value

Technical dependency

Risk mitigation

Correct answer: Number of requirement changes

While change is expected, the frequency of changes to a requirement isn't a primary
factor in determining its implementation priority.

High-value requirements identified by stakeholders should be prioritized.

Requirements that other features depend on must be done early.

Addressing risky requirements early reduces overall project risk.

Analysis



74.

Your team has just completed a series of facilitated workshops and interviews to
gather stakeholder needs for a new software platform. You've documented these
needs in a comprehensive requirements document. 

What is the most crucial next step before proceeding with design and development?

Obtain formal approval of the requirements document from key
stakeholders

Conduct a peer review of the requirements document to check for technical
accuracy

Develop a project schedule to estimate the timeline for implementing the
requirements

Create wireframes and mockups to visualize the user interface of the new
platform

Correct answer: Obtain formal approval of the requirements document from key
stakeholders

Obtaining formal approval (sign-off) on the requirements baseline is essential before
proceeding with development. This ensures that all stakeholders have reviewed and
agreed upon the documented requirements, reducing the risk of misunderstandings
or changes later in the project.

Peer review is important for quality assurance, but it happens before seeking
stakeholder approval.

Project scheduling is important, but it should be based on the approved requirements.

Wireframes and mockups are part of the design phase, which should start after
requirements are approved.

Analysis



75.

Your team is developing a new financial reporting system for a large organization.
The stakeholders have provided a set of high-level requirements, but you need to
have more granular, actionable tasks for the development team. 

Which technique would be most appropriate for achieving this?

Work Breakdown Structure (WBS)

Interface analysis

Data dictionary

Risk analysis

Correct answer: Work Breakdown Structure (WBS)

A Work Breakdown Structure (WBS) is a hierarchical decomposition of the project
scope into smaller, more manageable components. In this scenario, it would be used
to break down the high-level requirements into specific tasks or deliverables that can
be assigned to the development team. This helps ensure that all requirements are
addressed and provides a clear roadmap for the project.

Interface analysis focuses on how different system components interact, not on
decomposing requirements into tasks.

Data dictionaries define data elements and their relationships but not the tasks
required to implement the requirements.

Risk analysis identifies and assesses risks but doesn't directly decompose
requirements into actionable tasks.

Analysis



76.

What is the purpose of a requirement management tool in the context of requirements
specification?

To store, organize, and track changes to requirements throughout the
project lifecycle

Generate code automatically based on requirements

Create visual models of the system architecture

Facilitate communication between the business and the development team

Correct answer: To store, organize, and track changes to requirements throughout
the project lifecycle

Requirement management tools, such as the traceability matrix, are used to link and
track requirements throughout the project lifecycle and provide a central repository for
storing requirements, tracking changes, managing versions, and establishing
traceability.

Some advanced tools might have limited code generation capabilities, but this is not
the primary purpose of requirement management tools. Their main focus is on
documenting, organizing, and managing requirements, not generating code directly.

Visual modeling is often a separate activity, typically done using specialized modeling
tools (e.g. UML tools). Some requirement management tools may have basic
modeling features, but their main purpose is not to create complex system
architecture models.

Requirement management tools can help with communication by providing a shared
repository of information, but their primary purpose is broader than just facilitating
communication. They serve to manage the entire lifecycle of requirements, including
traceability, version control, and impact analysis.

Analysis



77.

You are working on a project to develop a new online learning platform. The
stakeholders have provided a vast number of requirements, including user stories,
feature requests, and technical specifications. 

What is the best way to organize these requirements to ensure that the most
important features are delivered first?

Use a prioritization matrix to rank the requirements based on their
business value, urgency, and feasibility

Create a comprehensive spreadsheet listing all requirements and sort them
alphabetically

Start developing the features that seem easiest to implement

Randomly select a set of requirements and start working

Correct answer: Use a prioritization matrix to rank the requirements based on their
business value, urgency, and feasibility

A prioritization matrix is a valuable tool for organizing and prioritizing requirements. It
allows you to systematically evaluate each requirement based on multiple criteria,
such as business value, urgency, and feasibility. This ensures that the most important
and valuable features are developed first, maximizing the return on investment for the
project.

Sorting requirements alphabetically doesn't help prioritize them based on their
importance or value.

Starting with the easiest features might not align with the overall business goals and
priorities.

Randomly selecting requirements can lead to a disorganized development process
and potentially miss critical features.

Analysis



78.

You're working on a project with a fixed budget and a tight deadline. Which
prioritization model would be most suitable to maximize the value delivered within
these constraints?

Cost of delay

Timeboxing

Value versus risk

Kano model 

Correct answer: Cost of delay

The cost of delay model focuses on prioritizing features based on the economic
impact of delaying their implementation. This helps maximize value delivery within
time and budget constraints.

Timeboxing sets a fixed timeframe for each task but doesn't inherently prioritize
based on value.

Value versus risk prioritizes based on the combination of value and risk, not
necessarily on budget constraints.

The Kano model categorizes features into different types but doesn't directly address
budget and time constraints.

Analysis



79.

After conducting usability testing on a new software interface, you receive feedback
from users indicating that certain features are difficult to find and use. What is the
most appropriate next step?

Document the feedback and meet with the development team for
potential changes

Ignore the feedback and proceed with development of the product as planned

Conduct additional usability testing with a larger group of users to confirm the
findings

Immediately implement changes to the interface based on the user feedback 

Correct answer: Document the feedback and meet with the development team for
potential changes

Documenting the feedback ensures it's not lost, and meeting with the development
team allows for a discussion on how best to address the usability issues identified
during testing.

Ignoring user feedback can lead to a product that doesn't meet user needs, resulting
in low adoption and satisfaction.

Additional testing can be valuable, but it's important to first address the known issues
before expanding the scope of testing.

Implementing changes without careful consideration and discussion with the
development team could lead to unintended consequences or suboptimal solutions.

Analysis



80.

Which modeling technique is best suited for visualizing the hierarchical structure of a
system's processes?

Process model

Data flow diagram

Decision tree

Ecosystem map 

Correct answer: Process model

Process models are useful tools for understanding complex systems. They break the
system into manageable processes, which helps identify interactions, inputs, and
outputs at each step.

Unlike process hierarchy diagrams, data flow diagrams emphasize the movement of
data within a system rather than the hierarchical structure of the processes.

Decision trees concentrate on modeling decision points and resulting outcomes
rather than the overall structure of a process.

Ecosystem maps serve to illustrate the connections among organizations rather than
their internal processes.

Analysis



81.

Which of the following is not a typical responsibility of a business analyst during the
sign-off process?

Making the final decision on whether the requirements baseline is
approved

Facilitating sign-off meetings with stakeholders

Addressing stakeholder concerns and questions about the requirements

Ensuring that all stakeholders have reviewed and understood the
requirements

Correct answer: Making the final decision on whether the requirements baseline is
approved

The business analyst plays a crucial role in facilitating the sign-off process, but the
final decision on approval typically rests with the project sponsor or other key
decision-makers. The business analyst's role is to ensure stakeholders understand
the requirements and their concerns are addressed.

Facilitating sign-off meetings is a core responsibility of the business analyst.

It is crucial for business analysts to prioritize addressing stakeholder concerns to gain
their approval and buy-in, as it falls within their purview and responsibilities.

For successful project sign-off, it is essential that stakeholders have a clear
understanding of the project's goals, scope, and deliverables. The business analyst
holds the responsibility of facilitating this understanding among stakeholders.

Analysis



82.

During a requirements validation session, a stakeholder points out that a specific
requirement seems to contradict another requirement documented earlier in the
process. What is the best course of action to address this discrepancy?

Investigate the discrepancy, gather additional information, and propose
a resolution to the stakeholders

Ignore the stakeholders feedback and proceed with the existing requirements

Modify the requirement without consulting the other stakeholders to avoid
further conflict

Escalate the issue to the project manager and let them handle the conflict

Correct answer: Investigate the discrepancy, gather additional information, and
propose a resolution to the stakeholders

The best course of action is to investigate the discrepancy thoroughly. This might
involve reviewing relevant documents, consulting with subject-matter experts, or
gathering additional input from stakeholders. Once you have a better understanding
of the issue, you can propose a resolution that aligns with the project goals and
satisfies the stakeholders' needs.

Ignoring feedback can lead to problems later in the project.

Modifying the requirement without consultation can lead to further conflicts and
misunderstandings.

Escalation might be necessary in some cases, but it's usually best to try to resolve
the conflict at a lower level first. 

Analysis



83.

Your project manager wants to visually track how the project team is addressing and
mitigating identified risks throughout the project lifecycle. Which tool would be most
helpful?

Risk burndown chart

Risk register

Gantt chart

Ishikawa diagram (fishbone diagram)

Correct answer: Risk burndown chart

A risk burndown chart visually shows the reduction of project risk over time. This
allows the project manager and team to track progress and identify areas where risk
mitigation efforts need to be intensified.

A risk register lists and describes risks but doesn't show their change over time.

A Gantt chart shows task schedules, not risk reduction.

An Ishikawa diagram is a cause-and-effect diagram used for root cause analysis, not
risk tracking.

Analysis



84.

After obtaining sign-off on the requirements baseline, what is the next step in the
project lifecycle?

Solution design

Project closure

Solution validation

Solution implementation

Correct answer: Solution design

Once the requirements are finalized and approved, the project team can proceed with
designing the solution. This involves translating the requirements into a detailed plan
for how the product or service will be built.

Project closure occurs at the end of the project.

Solution validation occurs after the solution is built to ensure it meets the
requirements.

Solution implementation is the process of building the solution.

Analysis



85.

You are creating a story map to visualize the user journey through a new e-commerce
website. Which of the following would not be a typical element of a story map?

Wireframes

User activities

User stories

Epics 

Correct answer: Wireframes

Wireframes are valuable tools in the design process, but they are not typically
included directly in a story map. Wireframes are low-fidelity representations of the
user interface, focusing on layout and structure, while story maps focus on user
actions and goals.

All the following are elements of a story map:

User activities are high-level steps or tasks that a user would typically perform
to achieve a goal within the system (e.g., Browse Products, Add to Cart,
Checkout). They form the backbone of the story map.
User stories are smaller, more specific descriptions of user needs and wants,
often following the format "As a [user], I want to [action] so that [benefit]." They
are placed under the relevant user activities in the story map.
Epics are large, overarching user stories that can be broken down into smaller
user stories. They often represent significant features or functionalities of the
system and are used to group related user stories together.

Analysis



86.

You are working with a scrum team developing a mobile app. The team is using a
definition of ready to ensure that user stories are well-defined and ready for
development. Which of the following would typically be included in a definition of
ready report?

Acceptance criteria

User interface design

Code review

Deployment plan

Correct answer: Acceptance criteria

Acceptance criteria are the conditions that must be met for a user story to be
considered complete and done. They define the expected behavior of the system
from the user's perspective.

User interface design is usually created during the development process, after the
story is accepted into a sprint.

Code review is a quality assurance practice that happens after the code is written.

The deployment plan, which is not considered part of the definition of ready, details
the process for deploying the software into production.

Analysis



87.

Your project team is supporting the development of an automated inventory
management system. You are asked to document the various business rules that
govern how stock levels are maintained, such as when to reorder items, how to
calculate safety stock, and how to handle returns. 

Which tool or technique would be most suitable for capturing and organizing this
information?

Business rule catalog

Product backlog

Definition of ready

Use case diagram

Correct answer: Business rule catalog

A business rule catalog is specifically designed to capture and manage business
rules in a structured manner. It allows you to define the rules, their conditions, and the
actions to be taken when those conditions are met. This makes it ideal for
documenting the complex inventory management roles in this scenario.

A product backlog is a prioritized list of work items for the development team, and it is
not the right place to document business rules.

Definition of ready is a term that specifies the criteria for a user story to be considered
ready for development. It’s not used for documenting business rules.

A case diagram shows the interactions between users and a system, not the detailed
business logic governing the system systems behavior.

Analysis



88.

You are working on a complex project involving multiple stakeholders with conflicting
needs. Which model and technique would be most effective in visualizing the
relationships between various project elements and identifying potential areas of
conflict?

Stakeholder map

Data flow diagram

Entity-relationship diagram

Context diagram

Correct answer: Stakeholder map

A stakeholder map analyzes stakeholders, their relationships, interests, and power
within a project. It helps identify potential conflicts and guide communication for
smooth project execution.

A data flow diagram illustrates the flow of data through a system, but it does not
showcase the connections between stakeholders.

An entity-relationship diagram models structures, not stakeholder interactions.

A context diagram depicts a system's boundaries and interactions with external
entities, but it does not provide details about the relationships between stakeholders
within the system.

Analysis



89.

Your team is developing a new accounting software. To validate if the software can
handle complex financial calculations accurately, which validation technique would be
most appropriate?

Simulation 

Walkthrough

Prototype

User acceptance testing 

Correct answer: Simulation

Simulation allows you to model complex financial calculations and scenarios to test if
the software produces accurate results under various conditions. This helps identify
and rectify calculation errors before the software is deployed.

Walkthroughs are useful for understanding requirements but not for validating
complex calculations.

Prototypes may not be able to handle the complexity of financial calculations. 

User acceptance testing focuses on validating user needs and overall functionality,
not the accuracy of specific calculations.

Analysis



90.

Your team is developing a new mobile banking app. To validate the User Interface
(UI) design and ensure it meets customer expectations, which technique would be
most appropriate?

Develop a prototype and gather feedback from potential users

Conduct a document review of the UI specifications

Perform a gap analysis to compare the UI design with competitor apps

Create a risk register to identify potential usability issues 

Correct answer: Develop a prototype and gather feedback from potential users

A prototype allows users to interact with a simulated version of the app, providing
valuable feedback on the User Interface (UI) design, navigation, and overall user
experience before development is complete.

Reviewing specifications doesn't provide the same level of hands-on experience as a
prototype.

Gap analysis focuses on comparing features to competitors, not validating user
experience.

Risk registers identify potential risks but don't directly validate the UI design.

Analysis



91.

During the sign-off meeting, a stakeholder raises a concern about a requirement that
was not previously identified. What is the best course of action?

Acknowledge the concern, document the new requirement, and assess
its impact

Dismiss the concern about the requirement, as the baseline has already been
finalized

Add the new requirement to the baseline without further discussion

Thank the stakeholder for their input and explain that the requirement will be
addressed in a future project phase 

Correct answer: Acknowledge the concern, document the new requirement, and
assess its impact

Taking the steps to acknowledge, address, document and assess the requirement’s
impact is the most professional and proactive approach. It acknowledges the
stakeholder's concern, captures the new requirement, and assesses its impact before
making any changes to the approved baseline.

Dismissing the concern risks alienating the stakeholder and could lead to problems
later in the project.

Adding the requirement without assessment could disrupt the project timeline and
budget.

Addressing the requirement in a future phase might be a possibility, but it should be
explored only after assessing the impact and discussing it with stakeholders.

Analysis



92.

You are working on a complex system with multiple components. To understand and
document the relationships and dependencies between these components, which tool
would be most appropriate?

Interaction matrix

CRUD matrix

Risk register

Event list 

Correct answer: Interaction matrix

An interaction matrix is a table that illustrates the relationships and dependencies
between different system components, subsystems, or actors. It helps visualize how
changes in one component might affect others, aiding in design and analysis.

CRUD matrices focus on user permissions on data entities, not component
interactions.

Event lists detail events, not the relationships between components.

Risk registers document project risks, not system component interactions. 

Analysis



93.

You are working on a business solution project to redesign a company's intranet
portal. You need to visualize the proposed layout of the new portal, including the
various sections, navigation menus, and content areas. 

Which model would be most effective in presenting this information to stakeholders?

Site map

Organizational chart

User interface flow

Interaction matrix

Correct answer: Site map

A site map is a visual representation of a website structure, showing the hierarchy of
pages and how they are interconnected. This would be the most effective way to
present the proposed layout of the internet portal to stay cold, as it gives a clear
overview of the organization and navigation of content.

An organizational chart shows the hierarchy of people within a company, not web
pages.

A user interface flow focuses on the steps a user takes to complete a task, not the
overall layout.

An interaction matrix shows relationships between components, not the structure of a
website.

Analysis



94.

You are working on a project to develop a new Enterprise Resource Planning (ERP)
system for a manufacturing company. The system will integrate various departments,
including sales, finance, inventory, and production. 

Which modeling technique would you use to visualize the complex interactions and
dependencies between these different modules?

System interface table 

State table

Interaction matrix

Report table

Correct answer: System interface table

System interface tables are specifically designed to document the interfaces between
different systems or modules within a system. It captures information such as the
data exchanged, the frequency of exchange, and the protocols used. This makes it
the most appropriate choice for visualizing the complex interactions between the
different modules of the Enterprise Resource Planning (ERP) system.

In contrast to documenting interfaces between modules, a state table primarily
emphasizes the various states that a system can occupy.

An interaction matrix shows relationships between components, but it doesn't provide
the same level of detail as a system interface table.

Unlike system interfaces, report tables are not ideal for visualizing data because they
present information in a structured, tabular format.

Analysis



95.

You are writing user stories for a new e-commerce platform. Which of the following
examples best represents a well-written user story?

"As a customer, I want a search bar, so I can easily find the products I'm
looking for."

“As a customer, I want to be able to browse products.”

Implement a secure payment gateway

The website should be user friendly

Correct answer: "As a customer, I want a search bar, so I can easily find the products
I'm looking for."

A well-written user story follows the format: "As a [role], I want [goal] so that [reason]."
The correct answer adheres to this format, clearly stating the role (customer), the
goal (search bar), and the reason (easily find products).

The statement, “As a customer, I want to be able to browse products,” is too broad
and doesn't specify the desired functionality.

Implementing a secure payment gateway is a technical task, not a user story.

The website being user friendly is a non-functional requirement, not a user story.

Analysis



96.

In allocating requirements, you identify a gold-plating scenario, where the
development team wants to exceed the specified requirement. Which of the following
is the best course of action?

Reiterate the approved requirements and the project scope

Allow the team to proceed, as they are motivated

Document the change and inform the project sponsor

Negotiate a compromise to partially fulfill the team's desire

Correct answer: Reiterate the approved requirements and the project scope.

Gold plating is adding unnecessary features that don't align with the original
requirements or project goals. The best action is to refocus the team on the approved
scope.

Allowing the team to proceed could lead to scope creep and budget overruns.

Documenting and informing the sponsor is not the immediate action to take.

Negotiating a compromise might not be necessary if the requirement is truly gold
plating.

Analysis



97.

A project team is validating requirements for a new customer service chatbot. They
want to ensure the chatbot can understand and respond appropriately to diverse user
queries. 

Which validation technique would be most effective in this scenario?

Create a prototype and test it with a sample of potential users

Conduct a walkthrough of the chatbot’s conversation flows

Perform a document review of the chatbot’s natural language processing
algorithms

Develop a risk mitigation plan to address potential communication
breakdowns

Correct answer: Create a prototype and test it with a sample of potential users

Testing the chatbot prototype with real users is the most effective way to validate its
understanding and response capabilities. This allows the team to identify areas where
the chatbot needs improvement in comprehending and responding to user input.

Walkthroughs are helpful for understanding the flow but don't test the chatbot's actual
performance.

Document reviews examine algorithms but don't validate their real-world
effectiveness.

Risk mitigation plans are important but don't directly validate the chatbot's ability to
understand and respond.

Analysis



98.

Which of the following is an example of a leading indicator?

Employee engagement scores

Number of customer complaints

Sales revenue

Net profit margin

Correct answer: Employee engagement scores

Leading indicators predict future outcomes. Engaged employees are more likely to be
productive, innovative, and provide better customer service, which can lead to
increased sales and profitability.

Number of customer complaints is a lagging indicator that reflects past issues.

Sales revenue is a lagging indicator that measures past performance.

Net profit margin is also a lagging indicator that measures past financial performance.

Analysis


